
Knox County, Tennessee

September 01, 2016

A R L I N G T O N   P R O P E R T I E S
217 2nd AVENUE NORTH

BIRMINGHAM, ALABAMA 35203

Preliminary Design Concepts

PHONE: 205-328-9600
www.arlingtonproperties.net

charlan brock & associates

FAX. 407-875-9948
PH.  407-660-8900

MAITLAND, FLORIDA 32751
1770 FENNELL STREET

www.cbaarchitects.com
CONTACT: DOUG ANDERSON

EMAIL: DOUG@CBAARCHITECTS.COM
E-MAIL: JOHNBAILES@ADVANCEDSTRUCTURALDESIGN.COM

1265 S. SEMORAN BLVD.

WINTER PARK, FLORIDA 32792

STRUCTURAL ENGINEER

CONTACT: JOHN BAILES

PH.  407-677-5836

ADVANCED STRUCTURAL DESIGN

SUITE 1201

ARCHITECT

SUITE 1021

E-MAIL: EGONZALEZ@MIGRE-ENG.COM

155 EAST WILDMERE AVE.

LONGWOOD, FLORIDA 32750

MEP ENGINEER

CONTACT: EDWIN GONZALEZ

PH.  407-636-7999

MiGre Engineers, LLC

3887A0.01

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

0
.
0
1

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

PROJECT

COVER SHEET

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



TO THE BEST OF CHARLAN, BROCK &  ASSOCIATES  KNOWLEDGE THESE
PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS COMPLY WITH ALL APPLICABLE MINIMUM
BUILDING CODES, FIRE SAFETY CODES, AND HANDICAP ACCESSIBILITY
CODES AS DETERMINED BY THE LOCAL GOVERNING AUTHORITY.

City of Knoxville Zoning Ordinance (with amendments)

2009 ICC/ANSI A117.1

2012 International Energy Conservation Code as adopted by City Ordinance
0-219-2012

2012 Green Construction Code as adopted by City Ordinance 0-27-2014

2012 International Building Code as adopted by City Ordinance 0-221-2012

2012 International Existing Building Code as adopted by City Ordinance 0-226-2012

2012 International Residential Code as adopted by City Ordinance 0-218-2012

2012 International Performance Code as adopted by City Ordinance 0-220-2012

2011 edition of the National Electrical Code as adopted by City Ordinance
0-132-2014

2012 edition of the International Fuel Gas Code as adopted by City Ordinance
0-223-2012

2012 edition of the International Mechanical Code as adopted by City Ordinance
0-222-2012

2012 edition of the International Plumbing Code as adopted by City Ordinance
0-224-2012

2012 edition of the International Property Maintenance Code as adopted by City
Ordinance 0-225-2012

Knoxville Code of Ordinances: Chapter 6 Buildings and Building Regulations, Article I,
Section 6-5. Fire District

2012 International Fire Code with Local Amendments as adopted by City Ordinance
0-227-2012

FAIR HOUSING ACT DESIGN MANUAL- 1998 (DWELLING UNITS)

ADA ACCESSIBILITY GUIDELINES- 2010 (LEASING CENTER)

A.B.
A/C
ACOUST.
ADJ.
A.H.U.
ALUM.
ALT.
APPROX.
BRG. 
BD. 
BLDG.
BLK.
B.M.
BTM.
COL.

CER.
C.J.
CLG.

ANCHOR BOLT
AIR CONDITIONER
ACOUSTICAL
ADJACENT
AIR HANDLER UNIT
ALUMINUM
ALTERNATE
APPROXIMATE
BEARING
BOARD
BUILDING
BLOCK
BEAM
BOTTOM
COLUMN

CERAMIC
CONSTRUCTION JOINT
CEILING

ELEVATION
EXPANSION JOINT

EACH
DRAWING
DISHWASHER

DOWN
DEAD LOAD
DISPOSAL
DIMENSION
DIAMETER
DETAIL
DOUBLE
DRYER

CENTER
CONTINUOUS
CONSTRUCTION
CONCRETE
CONCRETE BLOCK

ELEV..
E.J.

EA..
DWG.
D.W.

DN..
D.L.
DISP.
DIM.
DIAM.
DET.
DBL.
D

CTR.
CONT.
CONST.
CONC.
C.M.U.

EQ..
EST.
EXIST.
EXT.
FN..FL.
FIN.

F.G.
F.P.
FT.
FTG..
GA.
GALV.
GL..
GYP.
H.B.
H.C.
HDWR.
H.M.

EQUAL
ESTIMATE
EXISTING
EXTERIOR
FINISH FLOOR
FINISH

FIXED GLASS
FIREPLACE
FEET
FOOTING
GAGE
GALVANIZED
GLASS
GYPSUM
HOSE BIB
HOLLOW CORE
HARDWARE
HOLLOW METAL

MINIMUM
MECHANICAL
MEDICINE CABINET
MAXIMUM
MATERIAL
LIGHTING

LAVATORY
LAMINATED
POUND
JOINT
JOIST.
INTERIOR
INSULATION
INCHES
HTR.
HEATING
HEIGHT
HORIZONTAL

MIN.
MECH.
M.C.
MAX.
MATL.
LTG..

LAV.
LAM.
LB..
JT..
JST..
INT.
INSUL.
IN.
HTR..
HTG.
HT..
HORIZ.

MISC.
M.O.
M.T.
MTL..
O.A.
O.C.
O.D.
OPP.

P.
P.C.
PED.
PERP.
PL..
PLYWD. 
PROP.
P.S.F.

P.S.I.

MISCELLANEOUS
MASONRY OPENING
METAL THRESHOLD
METAL
OVERALL
ON CENTER
OUTSIDE DIAMETER
OPPOSITE
OPTIONAL
PANTRY
PULL CHAIN
PEDESTAL
PERPENDICULAR
PLATE
PLYWOOD
PROPERTY
POUND PER 

POUND PER SQUARE INCH

OPT.

REF.

SECTION

SCHEDULE
SOLID CORE
ROUGH SAWN
ROOM
REVISION / REVERSE
REQUIRED
REINFORCE
REFRIGERATOR
ROOF DRAIN
RADIUS
RETURN AIR GRILL
QUANTITY
QUALITY
PAPER HOLDER
PARTITION
PRESSURE TREATED

SEC.

SCHED..
S.C.
ROS.
RM..
REV.
REQD.
REINF.

R.D.
RAD.
R.A.G.
QUAN..
QUAL.
P.H.
PTN..
P.T.

SH. SHELF

VERTICALVERT.

SHT.
SIM.
S.G.D.
SQ.

S.S
STD.
STO.
STR.

SUP.
T.C.
TEMP.
THK.
TYP.
U.L.
VENT.

SHEET
SIMILAR
SLIDING GLASS DOOR
SQUARE

STAINLESS STEEL
STANDARD
STORAGE
STRUCTURAL
SUBSTITUTE
SUPPORT
TRASH COMPACTOR

THICK/THICKNESS
TYPICAL
UNDERWRITERS LABORATORY
VENTILATION

SUB.

TEMPERATURE

W.P. WATERPROOF
WALK-IN-CLOSET
WATER HEATER
WINDOW
WOOD
WATER CLOSET
WIDTH / WIDE / WASHER
VENT THROUGH ROOF
VOLUME

W.I.C.
W.H.
W.D.W.
WD..
W.C.
W.
V.T.R.
VOL.

EXTERIOR INSULATIONE.I.F.S.

EXPANDED POLY-E.P.S.
STYRENE SYSTEM

FINISH SYSTEM

SQUARE FOOT

CER. CERAMIC

METAL STUD WALL
1-HOUR FIRE RATED WALL
2- HOUR FIRE RATED WALL
FRAME WALL W/ INSULATION

BEARING FRAME WALLS

BLOCK WALL - PLAN

POURED WALL

DIMENSIONAL LUMBER

BATT INSULATION

RIGID FOAM / INSULATION

CUT LUMBER
PLYWOOD
EARTH FILL

CONCRETE MASONRY UNIT

STRUCTURAL STEEL

FLOOR TRUSS

NOTES:

THESE WOOD FRAME BUILDINGS, AS WITH ALL STRUCTURES, ONCE COMPLETED
WILL REQUIRE CONTINUOUS AND ONGOING MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR TO KEEP
THEM IN GOOD CONDITION AND PREVENT DETERIORATION OVER TIME.  THE
DEVELOPER IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE CONTRACTOR NEEDS TO DEVELOP A
MAINTENANCE PROGRAM BASED UPON THE MATERIALS AND SYSTEMS
INCORPORATED INTO THE BUILDINGS. THE OWNER OR THE LEASING /
MANAGEMENT COMPANY WILL NEED TO PROVIDE FOR A QUALIFIED
MAINTENANCE STAFF TO PROVIDE CONTINUED MAINTENANCE, RE-PAINTING,
RE-APPLICATION OF SEALANTS AND OTHER REPAIR WORK AS REQUIRED BY THE
MAINTENANCE PROGRAM FOR THE PROJECT. IF THE PROJECT IS SOLD TO A THIRD
PARTY, THE THIRD PARTY MUST CONTINUE TO PROVIDE THE MAINTENANCE
PROGRAM ESTABLISHED BY THE OWNER.  THE THIRD PARTY, LIKE ALL BUILDING
OWNERS, IS REQUIRED TO MAINTAIN AND REPAIR THE BUILDING TO THE MINIMUM
LEVEL ESTABLISHED IN THE MAINTENANCE PROGRAM.

GROUP R-2
CONSTRUCTION TYPE: TYPE V-A
SPRINKLED: NFPA - 13R

ALLOWED: 3 STORIES / 50'
4 STORIES / 60' (INCREASE PER IBC 504.2)

PROPOSED: 4 STORIES, 48'-5"

ALLOWED: 12,000 SQ. FT.
21,000 SQ. FT. (INCREASE PER IBC 506)

PROPOSED: 16,771 SQ. FT. max.

STRUCTURAL FRAME: 1 HOUR
INTERIOR BEARING WALL: 1 HOUR
EXTERIOR BEARING WALL: 1 HOUR
EXT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR (IBC TABLE 602)
INT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
FLOOR CONSTRUCTION: 1 HOUR
ROOF CONSTRUCTION: 1 HOUR

TENANT SEPARATION: 1 HOUR (IBC 708.3)
CORRIDOR: 1 HOUR (IBC 1018.1)

NFPA 101 TABLE A.10.2.2

EXIT ACCESS
CORRIDORS

ROOMS AND
ENCLOSED SPACES

B C

GROUP SPRINKLERED (NFPA - 13R)

R-2 A

VERTICAL
EXITS

BUILDING HEIGHT AS MEASURED FROM THE LOWEST GRADE POINT TO THE 
TOP OF ROOF = 44'-6"

SIDINGSDNG.

DRYWALLDRYW.

A

5

10101

SPACE NAME

SPACE NUMBER

DETAIL NUMBER

SHEET NUMBER

DETAIL NUMBER
DETAIL NAME

SECTION NUMBER
SECTION ORIENTATION

SHEET NUMBER WHERE
SECTION OCCURS

SECTION NUMBER
SECTION ORIENTATION

SHEET NUMBER WHERE
SECTION OCCURS

ELEVATION NUMBER
ELEVATION ORIENTATION

SHEET NUMBER WHERE
ELEVATION OCCURS

DETAIL NUMBER

SHEET NUMBER

DETAIL AREA

UNIT NUMBER

ALTERNATE UNIT
TYPE 

44
'-6

"

GROUP U
CONSTRUCTION TYPE: TYPE V-B
NON-SPRINKLED

ALLOWED: 2 STORIES / 60'
PROPOSED: 1 STORIES

ALLOWED: 9,000 SQ. FT.
PROPOSED: 1,030 SQ. FT.

STRUCTURAL FRAME: 1 HOUR
INTERIOR BEARING WALL: 1 HOUR
EXTERIOR BEARING WALL: 1 HOUR
EXT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
INT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
FLOOR CONSTRUCTION: 1 HOUR
ROOF CONSTRUCTION: N/A

GROUP U
CONSTRUCTION TYPE: TYPE V-B
NON-SPRINKLED

ALLOWED: 2 STORIES / 40'
PROPOSED: 1  STORIES

ALLOWED: 5,500 SQ. FT.
PROPOSED: 1,054 SQ. FT. max.

STRUCTURAL FRAME: 0 HOUR
INTERIOR BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
EXTERIOR BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
EXT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
INT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
FLOOR CONSTRUCTION: 0 HOUR
ROOF CONSTRUCTION: 0 HOUR

MIXED OCCUPANCY W/ USE GROUPS: A-3 & B
(NON-SEPARATED)
CONSTRUCTION TYPE: TYPE V-B
NON-SPRINKLED

ALLOWED: 2 STORIES / 60'
PROPOSED: 1  STORIES

ALLOWED:  6,000 SQ. FT.
10,500 SQ. FT. (INCREASE PER IBC 506.3)

PROPOSED: 6,543 SQ. FT.

STRUCTURAL FRAME: 0 HOUR
INTERIOR BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
EXTERIOR BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
EXT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
INT. NON-BEARING WALL: 0 HOUR
FLOOR CONSTRUCTION: 0 HOUR
ROOF CONSTRUCTION: 0 HOUR

CORRIDOR: 0 HOUR

1015.2.1 WHERE TWO EXITS OR EXIT ACCESS DOORWAYS
ARE REQUIRED FROM ANY PORTION OF THE AREA
SERVED, AT LEAST TWO EXIT ACCESS DOORWAYS SHALL
BE PLACED AT A DISTANCE APART OF NO LESS THAN ONE
HALF OF THE LENGTH OF THE MAXIMUM OVERALL
DIAGONAL DIMENSION OF THE AREA SERVED, MEASURED
IN A STRAIGHT LINE BETWEEN EXIT ACCESS DOORWAYS.

IBC TABLE 803.9 & NFPA 101 TABLE A.10.2.2

EXIT ACCESS
CORRIDORS

ROOMS AND
ENCLOSED SPACES

A C

GROUP UN-SPRINKLERED

B
A

VERTICAL
EXITS

B CA
A-3

BUILDING HEIGHT AS ALLOWED BY INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE = 60'-0"

** ALLOWABLE INCREASE IS BASED ON NFPA 13R SPRINKLER SYSTEM
INSTALLED PER 903.1.2.

ALLOWABLE HEIGHT PER TABLE 503 =  40'-0"
ALLOWABLE INCREASE PER 504       =  20'-0"

TOTAL = 60'-0"

IBC 1021.2:  TWO EXITS, OR EXIT ACCESS STAIRWAYS OR
RAMPS PROVIDING ACCESS TO EXITS, FROM ANY STORY
OR OCCUPIED ROOF SHALL BE PROVIDED WHERE ONE
OF THE FOLLOWING CONDITIONS EXISTS:

1.  THE OCCUPANT LOAD OR NUMBER OF DWELLING
UNITS EXCEEDS ONE OF THE VALUES IN TABLE 1021.2(1)
OR 1021.2(2)

TABLE 1021.2(1) STORIES WITH ONE EXIT OR ACCESS TO
ONE EXIT FOR R-2 OCCUPANCIES:

BASEMENT, 1ST, 2ND, 3RD STORY MAXIMUM NUMBER OF
DWELLING UNITS PER EXIT IS 4 DWELLING UNITS.

3887A0.03

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

0
.
0
3

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

ABBREVIATIONS,

SYMBOLS, MAPS

& CODES

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



Tapestry Turkey Creek

TOTALS UNITS 8

TYPE 1 
UNIT  B1
UNIT  B3 

1s
t

LE
V

ELBUILDING

LE
V

EL

1
2 2 2

8 8

2 2

BUILDING MIX

LE
V

EL

2s
t

3s
t

UNIT  A1 4 4 4

LE
V

EL

8

28

5

BL
D

.
PE

R

14

2

BL
D

S.
#

 O
F

2

16

56

10

TO
TA

L

28

UNIT  B1A 1 - - 1

2
2
2 2

4

Lo
w

er
LE

V
EL

0
2

2

0

TOTALS UNITS 8

TYPE 2 1s
t

LE
V

ELBUILDING

LE
V

EL

UNIT  B3 2 2 2

8 8

BUILDING MIX

LE
V

EL

2s
t

3s
t

UNIT  B1 2 4 4

LE
V

EL

6

24

BL
D

.
PE

R

10
1

1

BL
D

S.
#

 O
F

1
6

24

TO
TA

L

10

UNIT  B4 2 2 2 1 66
UNIT  B1A 2 - - 1 22

TOTALS UNITS 8

TYPE 3 1s
t

LE
V

ELBUILDING

LE
V

EL

UNIT  A3 1 2 2

8 8

BUILDING MIX

LE
V

EL

2s
t

3s
t

UNIT  A1 2 2 2

LE
V

EL

5

24
BL

D
.

PE
R

6
2

2
BL

D
S.

#
 O

F

2
10

48

TO
TA

L

12

UNIT  C1 3 4 4 11 2 22
UNIT  A3A
UNIT  C1A

1
1

-
-

-
-

1
1

2
2

2
2

TOTALS UNITS 12

TYPE 4 1s
t

LE
V

ELBUILDING

LE
V

EL

UNIT  B2 4 4 4

12 12

BUILDING MIX

LE
V

EL

2s
t

3s
t

UNIT  B1 6 8 8

LE
V

EL

12

36

BL
D

.
PE

R

22
1

1

BL
D

S.
#

 O
F

1
12

36

TO
TA

L

22

UNIT  B1A 2 - - 2 1 2

BUILDING AREA - TYPE 1

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:

9,596 SQ. FT.
9,316 SQ. FT.
9,316 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 33,330 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR:

R-2
TYPE V-A

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

(NFPA 13R SYSTEM)

12,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

60'-0" / 3 ST.HEIGHT/FLOORS LIMITATION:

9,596 SQ. FT.
44'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

3 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

BUILDING DATA - TYPE 1
A/C AREA PER FLOOR:

7,640 SQ. FT.
7,640 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 26,848 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR: 7,640 SQ. FT.

MAINTENANCE

U
TYPE V-B

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

5,500 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:
40'-0" / 1 ST.HEIGHT/FLOORS LIMITATION:

1054 SQ. FT.
16'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

1 STORYPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

TRASH COMPACTOR

U
TYPE V-B

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

5,500 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:
40'-0" / 1 ST.HEIGHT/FLOORS LIMITATION:

608 SQ. FT.
10'-1"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

1 STORYPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

SQUARE FOOTAGE TOTALS

BUILDING TOTALS

2
BUILDING TYPE TWO 1
BUILDING TYPE ONE

BUILDING TYPE THREE 2
BUILDING TYPE FOUR 1

BUILDING TYPE TOTAL BLDGS.

CLUBHOUSE 1
MAINTENANCE 1
TRASH COMPACTOR ENCLOSURE 1

TOTAL NUMBER OF BUILDINGS 12

BUILDING AREA - TYPE 2

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:
10,696 SQ. FT.
10,510 SQ. FT.
10,510 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 31,716 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR:

R-2
TYPE V-A

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

(NFPA 13R SYSTEM)

12,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

60'-0" / 3 ST.HEIGHT/FLOORS LIMITATION:

10,696 SQ.FT.
44'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

3 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

BUILDING DATA - TYPE 2
A/C AREA PER FLOOR:

9,306 SQ. FT.
9,306 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 27,918 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR: 9,306 SQ. FT.

BUILDING AREA - TYPE 3

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:
10,416 SQ. FT.
10,914 SQ. FT.
10,914 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 33,014 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR:

R-2
TYPE V-A

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

(NFPA 13R SYSTEM)

12,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

60'-0" / 3 ST.HEIGHT/FLOORS LIMITATION:

10,416 SQ. FT.
44'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

3 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

BUILDING DATA - TYPE 3
A/C AREA PER FLOOR:

8,516 SQ. FT.
8,516 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 25,548 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR: 8,516 SQ. FT.

BUILDING AREA - TYPE 4

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:
16,771 SQ. FT.
16,187 SQ. FT.
16,187 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 49,145 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR:

R-2
TYPE V-A

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

(NFPA 13R SYSTEM)

12,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

60'-0" / 3 ST.HEIGHT/FLOORS LIMITATION:

16,771 SQ. FT.
44'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

3 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

BUILDING DATA - TYPE 4
A/C AREA PER FLOOR:

13,620 SQ. FT.
13,620 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 40,680 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR: 13,620 SQ. FT.

21,000 SQ. FT.-FRONTAGE INCRS. FBC 506:

BUILDING TYPE 1 - AREA CALC'S
26,848 SQ. FT.
 33,330 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

26,848 SQ. FT.
33,330 SQ. FT.

x 2 =
x 2 =

BUILDING TYPE 2 - AREA CALC'S
27,918 SQ. FT.
31,716 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

27,918 SQ.FT.
31,716 SQ. FT.

x 1 =
x 1 =

BUILDING TYPE 3 - AREA CALC'S
51,096 SQ. FT.
66,028 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

25,548 SQ.FT.
33,014 SQ. FT.

x 2 =
x 2 =

BUILDING TYPE 4 - AREA CALC'S
40,680 SQ. FT.
49,145 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

40,680 SQ.FT.
49,145 SQ. FT.

x 1 =
x 1 =

CLUBHOUSE - AREA CALC'S
5,609 SQ. FT.
6,453 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

5,609 SQ. FT.
6,453 SQ. FT.

x 1 =
x 1 =

MAINTENANCE - AREA CALC'S

1,054 SQ. FT.
0 SQ. FT.A/C AREA TOTAL:

TOTAL AREA: 1054 SQ. FT.
0 SQ. FT. x 1 =

x 1 =

TRASH COMPACTOR - AREA CALC'S

608 SQ. FT.
0 SQ. FT.A/C AREA TOTAL:

TOTAL AREA: 608 SQ. FT.
0 SQ. FT. x 1 =

x 1 =

PROJECT TOTALS
239,364 SQ. FT.
291,798 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

PAVILION - AREA CALC'S

588 SQ. FT.
0 SQ. FT.A/C AREA TOTAL:

588 SQ. FT.
0 SQ. FT. x 1 =

x 1 =TOTAL AREA:

BUILDING AREA - CLUB

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:
6,453 SQ. FT.1ST FLR:

A/C AREA PER FLOOR:
5,609 SQ. FT.1ST FLR:

TOTAL AREA PER BUILDING:
2,612 SQ. FT.BALCONY:

TOTAL AREA PER BUILDING:
2,190 SQ. FT.BALCONY:

TOTAL AREA PER BUILDING:
2,540 SQ. FT.BALCONY:

TOTAL AREA PER BUILDING:

3,020 SQ. FT.BALCONY:

BUILDING AREA - TYPE 5
A/C AREA PER FLOOR:

212 SQ. FT.
1,418 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 1,630 SQ. FT.

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:

TOTAL:

1ST FL:
2ND FL:

1ST FL:
2ND FL:

R-2
TYPE V-A

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

(NFPA 13R SYSTEM)

12,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

1,540 SQ. FT.
24'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

2 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

BUILDING DATA - TYPE 5

1,540 SQ. FT.
1,548 SQ. FT.
3,088 SQ. FT.

TOTALS UNITS -

TYPE 5 1s
t

LE
V

ELBUILDING

LE
V

EL

2

BUILDING MIX

2s
t

UNIT  A2 - 2

2

BL
D

.
PE

R

2

1

BL
D

S.
#

 O
F

1

2

TO
TA

L

2

BUILDING TYPE FIVE 1

BUILDING TYPE 5 - AREA CALC'S
1,630 SQ. FT.
3,088 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

1,630 SQ.FT.
3,088 SQ.FT.

x 1 =
x 1 =

PAVILLION

PAVILLION 1

A-3
TYPE V-B

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

6,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

588 SQ.FT.
11'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

1 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

130 SQ. FT.BALCONY:

82%PROJECT EFFICIENCY
1,088 SQ.FT.AVERAGE UNIT SIZE:

LEASING / CLUB

BUILDING TYPE SIX 1

BUILDING TYPE 6 - AREA CALC'S
58,951 SQ. FT.
 74,960 SQ. FT.

A/C AREA TOTAL:
TOTAL AREA:

58,951 SQ.FT.
 74,960 SQ.FT.

x 1 =
x 1 =

TOTALS UNITS 18

TYPE 6 1s
t

LE
V

ELBUILDING

LE
V

EL

UNIT  B3 1 1 1

18 18

BUILDING MIX

LE
V

EL

2s
t

3s
t

UNIT  B1 8 8 8

LE
V

EL

3

54

BL
D

.
PE

R

24
1

1

BL
D

S.
#

 O
F

1
3

54

TO
TA

L

24
UNIT  A4 2 2 2 6 1 6

UNIT  B4 3 3 3 9 1 9
UNIT  B5 2 1 1 4 1 4

UNIT  A3 1 2 2 5 1 5

UNIT  C2 0 1 1 2 1 2
UNIT  A3A 1 - - 1 1 1

R-2
TYPE V-A

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

(NFPA 13R SYSTEM)

12,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

1,540 SQ. FT.
24'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

2 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

BUILDING DATA - TYPE 6 BUILDING AREA - TYPE 6

TOTAL AREA PER FLOOR:
25,364 SQ. FT.
24,798 SQ. FT.
24,798 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 74,960 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR:

A/C AREA PER FLOOR:
19,525 SQ. FT.
19,713 SQ. FT.

TOTAL: 58,951 SQ. FT.

1ST FLR:
2ND FLR:
3RD FLR: 19,713 SQ. FT.

TOTAL AREA PER BUILDING:

3,843 SQ. FT.BALCONY:

A-3
TYPE V-B

OCCUPANCY TYPE:
CONSTRUCTION TYPE:

6,000 SQ. FT.AREA LIMITATION PER FLR:

#############
22'-6"

PROPOSED AREA:
PROPOSED HEIGHT:

1 STORIESPROPOSED NO. FLOORS:

9,300 SQ. FT.-FRONTAGE INCRS. FBC 506:

.55=[376'/376'-.25]22'/30'

9300 SQ. FT.=6000+[6000x.55]+[6000x0]

I(f)=[F/P-.25]W/30

A(a)={A(t)+[A(t) x I(f)]+[A(t) x I(s)]}

15,300 SQ. FT. TOTAL

5,102 SQ. FT.BASEMENT FLR:

3,928 SQ. FT.BASEMENT FLR:

3887A0.04

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

0
.
0
4

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

PROJECT

DATA SHEET

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



1

3

4

LIGHT FIXTURE10

ALUMINUM RAILING

11

ALL BUILDING MOUNTED EQUIPMENT, PANELS, ETC. SHALL BE MOUNTED AFTER
EXTERIOR FINISH IS APPLIED AND PAINTED. IF SEQUENCING OF CONSTRUCTION
REQUIRES MOUNTING PRIOR TO THIS, CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT METHOD
OF MOUNTING AND WATERPROOFING TO ARCHITECT FOR APPROVAL. PLINTH
BLOCKING REQUIRED AT ALL PENETRATIONS AND SURFACE MOUNTED
FIXTURES INCLUDING CULTURED STONE.

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6. ALL EXTERIOR BALCONY RAILS TO BE POWDER COATED ALUMINUM.

7. ALL FINISH GRADE SHALL BE MINIMUM 8" BELOW FINISH FLOOR AND SLOPE
AWAY FROM BUILDING.

8. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT AT ALL SIDING, PANEL AND TRIM CONDITIONS.

9. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT W/ BOND BREAKER OR BACKER ROD (TO
PREVENT 3-SIDED ADHESION) AT PERIMETER OF WINDOWS  / DOORS.

10. PROVIDE SEALANT JOINTS AT INTERFACE BETWEEN DISSIMILAR SUBSTRATES,
SUCH  AS BALCONY CEILINGS, BALCONY EXTERIOR EDGES, EXTERIOR WALL TO
SOFFIT AND CEILING CONDITIONS ECT.

TYPICAL EXTERIOR CLADDING - COMBINATION OF CEMENTITIOUS LAPPED
SIDING, CEMENTITIOUS PANEL SIDING AND CULTURED STONE VENEER.
ENTIRE BUILDING TO  BE WRAPPED WITH BUILDING WRAP. INSIDE AND
OUTSIDE CORNERS TO BE PRE-WRAPPED WITH SELF-ADHERED MEMBRANE
FOR 6" EACH SIDE OF CORNER. STONE VENEER TO BE INSTALLED OVER
STUCCO BASE WITH METAL LATH ON DRAIN MAT ON AND #15 FELT OVER
BUILDING WRAP.
ALL EXTERIOR WOOD TRIM TO BE 5/4" HARDI TRIM.

ALL PENETRATIONS MUST BE PROPERLY FLASHED AND/OR SEALED.
ATTACHMENTS THROUGH EXTERIOR SKIN SHALL BE SET IN BED OF SEALANT.
REFER TO SHEETS   A7.41 & A7.42 FOR PENETRATION DETAILS.

ALL UNIT BALCONIES TO HAVE STRUCTURAL FLOOR SYSTEM SLOPED AWAY
FROM UNIT FOR DRAINAGE AT 14" PER FOOT.

ALUMINUM RAILING AT 42" A.F.F.13

METER LOCATION14

2

WALL TO ROOF "KICK OUT" FLASHING REQUIRED.
SEE NOTE 14 OF TYPICAL ELEVATION NOTES.

11. PROVIDE POSITIVE SLOPE 1:2 AT TOP OF METAL FLASHINGS AT TRIM BANDS,
TYPICAL.

12. ALL ATTACHMENT AND PENETRATION THRU THE EXTERIOR CLADDING SYSTEM
MUST  BE SEALED AGAINST POTENTIAL WATER INTRUSION.

13.   EXTERIOR WALLS TO BE PAINTED PRIOR TO INSTALLATION OF DOWNSPOUTS. ALL
DOWNSPOUTS TO BE 3"x5" BAKED ENAMEL ALUMINUM.

14.   ALL ROOF TO WALL INTERSECTIONS TO HAVE VERTICAL TERMINATION OF
UNDERLAYMENT- MIN. 8" AND "L" FLASHING WITH VERTICAL LEG EXTENDING
MINIMUM 6" UP THE WALL. ALL ROOF TO WALL EAVE TERMINATIONS MUST HAVE
KICK-OUT FLASHING.

15. REFER TO DETAIL3/A7.32 FOR TYPICAL PAINT DETAIL.

ARCHITECTURAL STYLE SHINGLES, OVER #30
FELT, OVER ROOF SHEATHING, OVER
PRE-EGINEERED ROOF TRUSSES.  PROVIDE 36"
WIDE 30 MIL SELF-ADHERING MEMBRANE,
CENTERED IN VALLEYS, OVER ROOF SHEATHING.

STANDING SEAM METAL ROOF OVER 40 MIL.
HIGH TEMPERATURE MEMBRANE. INSTALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

ALUMINUM DRIP EDGE ON ALUMINUM WRAPPED
TREATED 1X3 ON TREATED 2X10 FASCIA BOARD
WITH ALUMINUM GUTTER PER ROOF PLAN

ANODIZED ALUMINUM GUTTER & DOWNSPOUT
SYSTEM

5 4" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

6 8" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS

7 FIBER CEMENT PANEL VERTICAL SIDING OVER
RAINSCREEN OVER BLD. WRAP, OVER EXTERIOR
WALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS

8 STONE VENEER OVER 2 COATS OF STUCCO ON
PAPER BACK METAL LATH OVER BUILDING
WRAP. INSTALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS.

9 DECORATIVE BRACKET

12

15

BUILDING SIGNAGE

VERTICAL HARDIE BOARD TO BE SPACED 12" ON
CENTER.

16

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

12
4.5

12
4

12
4.5

12
4

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

12
4.5

12
4

12
4

UNIT B3 UNIT B1

UNIT B1 CORRIDOR UNIT A1 UNIT A1 CORRIDOR
UNIT B1

UNIT B1 "A" BELOW

1

8

9

13

19

8

10

10

10

13

7

3

4

2

1515

15

5

6

5

6

15

14

56
'-1

0"

46
'-0

"

3887A2.11

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

2
.
1
1

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

BUILDING TYPE

ONE

BUILDING

ELEVATIONS

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



1

3

4

LIGHT FIXTURE10

ALUMINUM RAILING

11

ALL BUILDING MOUNTED EQUIPMENT, PANELS, ETC. SHALL BE MOUNTED AFTER
EXTERIOR FINISH IS APPLIED AND PAINTED. IF SEQUENCING OF CONSTRUCTION
REQUIRES MOUNTING PRIOR TO THIS, CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT METHOD
OF MOUNTING AND WATERPROOFING TO ARCHITECT FOR APPROVAL. PLINTH
BLOCKING REQUIRED AT ALL PENETRATIONS AND SURFACE MOUNTED
FIXTURES INCLUDING CULTURED STONE.

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6. ALL EXTERIOR BALCONY RAILS TO BE POWDER COATED ALUMINUM.

7. ALL FINISH GRADE SHALL BE MINIMUM 8" BELOW FINISH FLOOR AND SLOPE
AWAY FROM BUILDING.

8. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT AT ALL SIDING, PANEL AND TRIM CONDITIONS.

9. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT W/ BOND BREAKER OR BACKER ROD (TO
PREVENT 3-SIDED ADHESION) AT PERIMETER OF WINDOWS  / DOORS.

10. PROVIDE SEALANT JOINTS AT INTERFACE BETWEEN DISSIMILAR SUBSTRATES,
SUCH  AS BALCONY CEILINGS, BALCONY EXTERIOR EDGES, EXTERIOR WALL TO
SOFFIT AND CEILING CONDITIONS ECT.

TYPICAL EXTERIOR CLADDING - COMBINATION OF CEMENTITIOUS LAPPED
SIDING, CEMENTITIOUS PANEL SIDING AND CULTURED STONE VENEER.
ENTIRE BUILDING TO  BE WRAPPED WITH BUILDING WRAP. INSIDE AND
OUTSIDE CORNERS TO BE PRE-WRAPPED WITH SELF-ADHERED MEMBRANE
FOR 6" EACH SIDE OF CORNER. STONE VENEER TO BE INSTALLED OVER
STUCCO BASE WITH METAL LATH ON DRAIN MAT ON AND #15 FELT OVER
BUILDING WRAP.
ALL EXTERIOR WOOD TRIM TO BE 5/4" HARDI TRIM.

ALL PENETRATIONS MUST BE PROPERLY FLASHED AND/OR SEALED.
ATTACHMENTS THROUGH EXTERIOR SKIN SHALL BE SET IN BED OF SEALANT.
REFER TO SHEETS   A7.41 & A7.42 FOR PENETRATION DETAILS.

ALL UNIT BALCONIES TO HAVE STRUCTURAL FLOOR SYSTEM SLOPED AWAY
FROM UNIT FOR DRAINAGE AT 14" PER FOOT.

ALUMINUM RAILING AT 42" A.F.F.13

METER LOCATION14

2

WALL TO ROOF "KICK OUT" FLASHING REQUIRED.
SEE NOTE 14 OF TYPICAL ELEVATION NOTES.

11. PROVIDE POSITIVE SLOPE 1:2 AT TOP OF METAL FLASHINGS AT TRIM BANDS,
TYPICAL.

12. ALL ATTACHMENT AND PENETRATION THRU THE EXTERIOR CLADDING SYSTEM
MUST  BE SEALED AGAINST POTENTIAL WATER INTRUSION.

13.   EXTERIOR WALLS TO BE PAINTED PRIOR TO INSTALLATION OF DOWNSPOUTS. ALL
DOWNSPOUTS TO BE 3"x5" BAKED ENAMEL ALUMINUM.

14.   ALL ROOF TO WALL INTERSECTIONS TO HAVE VERTICAL TERMINATION OF
UNDERLAYMENT- MIN. 8" AND "L" FLASHING WITH VERTICAL LEG EXTENDING
MINIMUM 6" UP THE WALL. ALL ROOF TO WALL EAVE TERMINATIONS MUST HAVE
KICK-OUT FLASHING.

15. REFER TO DETAIL3/A7.32 FOR TYPICAL PAINT DETAIL.

ARCHITECTURAL STYLE SHINGLES, OVER #30
FELT, OVER ROOF SHEATHING, OVER
PRE-EGINEERED ROOF TRUSSES.  PROVIDE 36"
WIDE 30 MIL SELF-ADHERING MEMBRANE,
CENTERED IN VALLEYS, OVER ROOF SHEATHING.

STANDING SEAM METAL ROOF OVER 40 MIL.
HIGH TEMPERATURE MEMBRANE. INSTALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

ALUMINUM DRIP EDGE ON ALUMINUM WRAPPED
TREATED 1X3 ON TREATED 2X10 FASCIA BOARD
WITH ALUMINUM GUTTER PER ROOF PLAN

ANODIZED ALUMINUM GUTTER & DOWNSPOUT
SYSTEM

5 4" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

6 8" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS

7 FIBER CEMENT PANEL VERTICAL SIDING OVER
RAINSCREEN OVER BLD. WRAP, OVER EXTERIOR
WALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS

8 STONE VENEER OVER 2 COATS OF STUCCO ON
PAPER BACK METAL LATH OVER BUILDING
WRAP. INSTALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS.

9 DECORATIVE BRACKET

12

15

BUILDING SIGNAGE

VERTICAL HARDIE BOARD TO BE SPACED 12" ON
CENTER.

16

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

12
4

12
412

4

12
4

12
4

12
4

UNIT B3 UNIT A3 UNIT B3

UNIT B1 UNIT B3

UNIT A3

1

13

8

10

1

13

9

7

15

15

5

6

3

4

15

46
'-0

"

46
'-0

"

3887A2.12

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

2
.
1
2

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

BUILDING TYPE

ONE

BUILDING

ELEVATIONS

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



1

3

4

LIGHT FIXTURE10

ALUMINUM RAILING

11

ALL BUILDING MOUNTED EQUIPMENT, PANELS, ETC. SHALL BE MOUNTED AFTER
EXTERIOR FINISH IS APPLIED AND PAINTED. IF SEQUENCING OF CONSTRUCTION
REQUIRES MOUNTING PRIOR TO THIS, CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT METHOD
OF MOUNTING AND WATERPROOFING TO ARCHITECT FOR APPROVAL. PLINTH
BLOCKING REQUIRED AT ALL PENETRATIONS AND SURFACE MOUNTED
FIXTURES INCLUDING CULTURED STONE.

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6. ALL EXTERIOR BALCONY RAILS TO BE POWDER COATED ALUMINUM.

7. ALL FINISH GRADE SHALL BE MINIMUM 8" BELOW FINISH FLOOR AND SLOPE
AWAY FROM BUILDING.

8. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT AT ALL SIDING, PANEL AND TRIM CONDITIONS.

9. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT W/ BOND BREAKER OR BACKER ROD (TO
PREVENT 3-SIDED ADHESION) AT PERIMETER OF WINDOWS  / DOORS.

10. PROVIDE SEALANT JOINTS AT INTERFACE BETWEEN DISSIMILAR SUBSTRATES,
SUCH  AS BALCONY CEILINGS, BALCONY EXTERIOR EDGES, EXTERIOR WALL TO
SOFFIT AND CEILING CONDITIONS ECT.

TYPICAL EXTERIOR CLADDING - COMBINATION OF CEMENTITIOUS LAPPED
SIDING, CEMENTITIOUS PANEL SIDING AND CULTURED STONE VENEER.
ENTIRE BUILDING TO  BE WRAPPED WITH BUILDING WRAP. INSIDE AND
OUTSIDE CORNERS TO BE PRE-WRAPPED WITH SELF-ADHERED MEMBRANE
FOR 6" EACH SIDE OF CORNER. STONE VENEER TO BE INSTALLED OVER
STUCCO BASE WITH METAL LATH ON DRAIN MAT ON AND #15 FELT OVER
BUILDING WRAP.
ALL EXTERIOR WOOD TRIM TO BE 5/4" HARDI TRIM.

ALL PENETRATIONS MUST BE PROPERLY FLASHED AND/OR SEALED.
ATTACHMENTS THROUGH EXTERIOR SKIN SHALL BE SET IN BED OF SEALANT.
REFER TO SHEETS   A7.41 & A7.42 FOR PENETRATION DETAILS.

ALL UNIT BALCONIES TO HAVE STRUCTURAL FLOOR SYSTEM SLOPED AWAY
FROM UNIT FOR DRAINAGE AT 14" PER FOOT.

ALUMINUM RAILING AT 42" A.F.F.13

METER LOCATION14

2

WALL TO ROOF "KICK OUT" FLASHING REQUIRED.
SEE NOTE 14 OF TYPICAL ELEVATION NOTES.

11. PROVIDE POSITIVE SLOPE 1:2 AT TOP OF METAL FLASHINGS AT TRIM BANDS,
TYPICAL.

12. ALL ATTACHMENT AND PENETRATION THRU THE EXTERIOR CLADDING SYSTEM
MUST  BE SEALED AGAINST POTENTIAL WATER INTRUSION.

13.   EXTERIOR WALLS TO BE PAINTED PRIOR TO INSTALLATION OF DOWNSPOUTS. ALL
DOWNSPOUTS TO BE 3"x5" BAKED ENAMEL ALUMINUM.

14.   ALL ROOF TO WALL INTERSECTIONS TO HAVE VERTICAL TERMINATION OF
UNDERLAYMENT- MIN. 8" AND "L" FLASHING WITH VERTICAL LEG EXTENDING
MINIMUM 6" UP THE WALL. ALL ROOF TO WALL EAVE TERMINATIONS MUST HAVE
KICK-OUT FLASHING.

15. REFER TO DETAIL3/A7.32 FOR TYPICAL PAINT DETAIL.

ARCHITECTURAL STYLE SHINGLES, OVER #30
FELT, OVER ROOF SHEATHING, OVER
PRE-EGINEERED ROOF TRUSSES.  PROVIDE 36"
WIDE 30 MIL SELF-ADHERING MEMBRANE,
CENTERED IN VALLEYS, OVER ROOF SHEATHING.

STANDING SEAM METAL ROOF OVER 40 MIL.
HIGH TEMPERATURE MEMBRANE. INSTALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

ALUMINUM DRIP EDGE ON ALUMINUM WRAPPED
TREATED 1X3 ON TREATED 2X10 FASCIA BOARD
WITH ALUMINUM GUTTER PER ROOF PLAN

ANODIZED ALUMINUM GUTTER & DOWNSPOUT
SYSTEM

5 4" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

6 8" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS

7 FIBER CEMENT PANEL VERTICAL SIDING OVER
RAINSCREEN OVER BLD. WRAP, OVER EXTERIOR
WALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS

8 STONE VENEER OVER 2 COATS OF STUCCO ON
PAPER BACK METAL LATH OVER BUILDING
WRAP. INSTALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS.

9 DECORATIVE BRACKET

12

15

BUILDING SIGNAGE

VERTICAL HARDIE BOARD TO BE SPACED 12" ON
CENTER.

16

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

12
4.5

12
4.5

12
4.5

12
4.5

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

12
4.5

12
4.5

12
4

UNIT B3 UNIT B1

UNIT B1 CORRIDOR UNIT B1 CORRIDOR
UNIT B1

UNIT B1 "A" BELOW

1

8

9

13

19

8

10

10

10

13

7

3

4

2

1515

15

5

6

5

6

15

14

46
'-0

"

46
'-0

"

UNIT B1

3887A2.21

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

2
.
2
1

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

BUILDING TYPE

TWO

BUILDING

ELEVATIONS

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



1

3

4

LIGHT FIXTURE10

ALUMINUM RAILING

11

ALL BUILDING MOUNTED EQUIPMENT, PANELS, ETC. SHALL BE MOUNTED AFTER
EXTERIOR FINISH IS APPLIED AND PAINTED. IF SEQUENCING OF CONSTRUCTION
REQUIRES MOUNTING PRIOR TO THIS, CONTRACTOR SHALL SUBMIT METHOD
OF MOUNTING AND WATERPROOFING TO ARCHITECT FOR APPROVAL. PLINTH
BLOCKING REQUIRED AT ALL PENETRATIONS AND SURFACE MOUNTED
FIXTURES INCLUDING CULTURED STONE.

1.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6. ALL EXTERIOR BALCONY RAILS TO BE POWDER COATED ALUMINUM.

7. ALL FINISH GRADE SHALL BE MINIMUM 8" BELOW FINISH FLOOR AND SLOPE
AWAY FROM BUILDING.

8. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT AT ALL SIDING, PANEL AND TRIM CONDITIONS.

9. PROVIDE URETHANE SEALANT W/ BOND BREAKER OR BACKER ROD (TO
PREVENT 3-SIDED ADHESION) AT PERIMETER OF WINDOWS  / DOORS.

10. PROVIDE SEALANT JOINTS AT INTERFACE BETWEEN DISSIMILAR SUBSTRATES,
SUCH  AS BALCONY CEILINGS, BALCONY EXTERIOR EDGES, EXTERIOR WALL TO
SOFFIT AND CEILING CONDITIONS ECT.

TYPICAL EXTERIOR CLADDING - COMBINATION OF CEMENTITIOUS LAPPED
SIDING, CEMENTITIOUS PANEL SIDING AND CULTURED STONE VENEER.
ENTIRE BUILDING TO  BE WRAPPED WITH BUILDING WRAP. INSIDE AND
OUTSIDE CORNERS TO BE PRE-WRAPPED WITH SELF-ADHERED MEMBRANE
FOR 6" EACH SIDE OF CORNER. STONE VENEER TO BE INSTALLED OVER
STUCCO BASE WITH METAL LATH ON DRAIN MAT ON AND #15 FELT OVER
BUILDING WRAP.
ALL EXTERIOR WOOD TRIM TO BE 5/4" HARDI TRIM.

ALL PENETRATIONS MUST BE PROPERLY FLASHED AND/OR SEALED.
ATTACHMENTS THROUGH EXTERIOR SKIN SHALL BE SET IN BED OF SEALANT.
REFER TO SHEETS   A7.41 & A7.42 FOR PENETRATION DETAILS.

ALL UNIT BALCONIES TO HAVE STRUCTURAL FLOOR SYSTEM SLOPED AWAY
FROM UNIT FOR DRAINAGE AT 14" PER FOOT.

ALUMINUM RAILING AT 42" A.F.F.13

METER LOCATION14

2

WALL TO ROOF "KICK OUT" FLASHING REQUIRED.
SEE NOTE 14 OF TYPICAL ELEVATION NOTES.

11. PROVIDE POSITIVE SLOPE 1:2 AT TOP OF METAL FLASHINGS AT TRIM BANDS,
TYPICAL.

12. ALL ATTACHMENT AND PENETRATION THRU THE EXTERIOR CLADDING SYSTEM
MUST  BE SEALED AGAINST POTENTIAL WATER INTRUSION.

13.   EXTERIOR WALLS TO BE PAINTED PRIOR TO INSTALLATION OF DOWNSPOUTS. ALL
DOWNSPOUTS TO BE 3"x5" BAKED ENAMEL ALUMINUM.

14.   ALL ROOF TO WALL INTERSECTIONS TO HAVE VERTICAL TERMINATION OF
UNDERLAYMENT- MIN. 8" AND "L" FLASHING WITH VERTICAL LEG EXTENDING
MINIMUM 6" UP THE WALL. ALL ROOF TO WALL EAVE TERMINATIONS MUST HAVE
KICK-OUT FLASHING.

15. REFER TO DETAIL3/A7.32 FOR TYPICAL PAINT DETAIL.

ARCHITECTURAL STYLE SHINGLES, OVER #30
FELT, OVER ROOF SHEATHING, OVER
PRE-EGINEERED ROOF TRUSSES.  PROVIDE 36"
WIDE 30 MIL SELF-ADHERING MEMBRANE,
CENTERED IN VALLEYS, OVER ROOF SHEATHING.

STANDING SEAM METAL ROOF OVER 40 MIL.
HIGH TEMPERATURE MEMBRANE. INSTALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

ALUMINUM DRIP EDGE ON ALUMINUM WRAPPED
TREATED 1X3 ON TREATED 2X10 FASCIA BOARD
WITH ALUMINUM GUTTER PER ROOF PLAN

ANODIZED ALUMINUM GUTTER & DOWNSPOUT
SYSTEM

5 4" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS.

6 8" REVEAL FIBER CEMENT LAP SIDING OVER BLD.
WRAP OVER EXTERIOR WALL PER
MANUFACTURER'S RECOMMENDATIONS

7 FIBER CEMENT PANEL VERTICAL SIDING OVER
RAINSCREEN OVER BLD. WRAP, OVER EXTERIOR
WALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS

8 STONE VENEER OVER 2 COATS OF STUCCO ON
PAPER BACK METAL LATH OVER BUILDING
WRAP. INSTALL PER MANUFACTURER'S
RECOMMENDATIONS.

9 DECORATIVE BRACKET

12

15

BUILDING SIGNAGE

VERTICAL HARDIE BOARD TO BE SPACED 12" ON
CENTER.

16

0'-0"
FIN. FLR.

10'-9 7/8"
T.O. PLYWD.

21'-7 3/4"
T.O. PLYWD.

-0'-8" MIN.
GRADE

9'-1 1/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

19'-11"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

30'-8 7/8"
TRUSS BRG.
8'-0" A.F.F.
HEAD HT.

12
4

12
412

4

12
4

12
4

12
4

UNIT B3 UNIT B4 UNIT B3

UNIT B1 UNIT B3

UNIT B4

1

13

8

10

1

13

9

7

15

15

5

6

3

4

15

46
'-0

"

46
'-0

"

3887A2.22

S
t
e
v
e
n
 
F

l
o
s
i
t
z

F
r
i
d
a
y
,
 
S

e
p
t
e
m

b
e
r
 
0
2
,
 
2
0
1
6

P
:
\
3
8
8
7
 
-
 
T

A
P

E
S

T
R

Y
 
A

T
 
K

N
O

X
V

I
L
L
E

\
D

R
A

W
I
N

G
S

\
1
_
A

P
A

R
T

M
E

N
T

\
0
0
_
C

U
R

R
E

N
T

\
3
8
8
7
A

2
.
2
2

1770           fennell         street 
maitland  florida  32751-7208
407 660 8900  f: 407 875 9948
www .  cbaarchitects  . com

drawn by:

job no:

reviewed by:

date:

ch
ar

la
n,

 b
ro

ck
 &

 a
ss

oc
ia

te
s, 

in
c.

 h
er

eb
y 

re
se

rv
es

 it
s c

om
m

on
 la

w
 c

op
yr

ig
ht

 a
nd

 o
th

er
 p

ro
pe

rty
 ri

gh
ts

 in
 th

es
e 

pl
an

s, 
id

ea
s, 

an
d

 d
es

ig
ns

.  
th

es
e 

id
ea

s, 
d

es
ig

ns
, a

nd
 p

la
ns

 a
re

 n
ot

 to
 b

e 
re

pr
od

uc
ed

, c
ha

ng
ed

 o
r c

op
ie

d
 in

 a
ny

 fo
rm

 o
r m

an
ne

r w
ha

ts
oe

ve
r, 

no
r a

re
 th

ey
 to

 b
e 

as
sig

ne
d

 to
 a

ny
 th

ird
 p

ar
ty

, w
ith

ou
t f

irs
t o

bt
ai

ni
ng

 th
e 

ex
pr

es
s w

rit
te

n 
pe

rm
iss

io
n 

fro
m

 c
.b

.a
., 

in
c.

 w
rit

te
n 

d
im

en
sio

ns
 sh

al
l h

av
e 

pr
ec

ed
en

ce
 o

ve
r s

ca
le

 d
im

en
sio

ns
.

issue history:

file:

associates
architects    planners

DC / DPA

BUILDING TYPE

TWO

BUILDING

ELEVATIONS

CBA

A
RL

IN
G

TO
N

 P
RO

PE
RT

IE
S

21
7 

2N
D

 A
V

EN
UE

 N
O

RT
H

BI
RM

IN
G

HA
M

, A
LA

BA
M

A
 3

52
03

PH
. 2

05
-3

28
-9

60
0

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

N
.

TA
PE

ST
RY

 T
UR

KE
Y 

C
RE

EK

C
ha

rla
n 

Br
oc

k 
&

 A
ss

oc
., 

A
C

05
49

KN
O

X 
C

O
UN

TY
, T

EN
N

ES
SE

E 

09-01-2016
3887.16

C
ha

rle
s L

. C
ha

rla
n,

 A
rc

hi
te

ct
, A

R6
99

3

TE
N

N
ES

SE
E

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



C

-

1

M

A

I
N

T

.

CLUBHOUSE

BUILDING 1

BUILDING 2

BUILDING 3
BUILDING 4

BUILDING 5

BUILDING 6

BUILDING 7

Date:
Drawn by:

Job Number:

Reviewed by:

Revision:

  Sheet Number:

Date:

 10/25/2016             3:45pm             S:\Work\Clients\Arlington\Knoxville Snyder\AutoCAD\Sheet Files\Code\X-Code 20161025.dwg,LC5.00,     mphillips

O
V

E
R

A
LL

 P
LA

N

09/28/2016

MP

RCC / MO

21532.5

A
rl

in
gt

on
 P

ro
pe

rt
ie

s
21

17
 S

ec
on

d 
A

ve
nu

e 
N

or
th

, S
ui

te
 3

00

T
A

PE
ST

R
Y

 T
U

R
K

E
Y

 C
R

E
E

K
K

no
xv

ill
e,

 T
N

B
ir

m
in

gh
am

, A
L

U
O

R
 S

U
B

M
IT

T
A

L-
LA

N
D

SC
A

PE
 P

LA
N

0 40 80

SCALE:  1" = 40'

UOR SUBMITTAL-LANDSCAPE PLAN
LC5.00

1 
5 

0 
  W

.  
 J

 E
 S

 S
 U

 P
   

A
 V

 E
 N

 U
 E

L 
O

 N
 G

 W
 O

 O
 D

,  
F 

L 
O

 R
 I 

D
 A

T 
E 

L 
  4

 0
 7

 . 
6 

6 
7 

. 1
 7

 7
 7

F 
A

 X
   

4 
0 

7 
. 6

 6
 7

 . 
1 

7 
7 

9

+

LEGEND

(13) INTERIOR PARKING CANOPY TREES
(2" CAL. WILLOW OAK)

INTERIOR PARKING

ISLAND CANOPY TREE,

TYP. (WILLOW OAK)

(9) ENTRANCE CANOPY TREES (2" CAL.
SHUMARD OAK) PLANTED AT 40' O.C.
AND (3) INTERIOR PARKING CANOPY
TREES (2" CAL. SHUMARD OAK)

(19) CANOPY TREES AT OPEN GREENSPACE
AREA (2" CAL. TULIP POPLAR) PLANTED AT
40' O.C.

EVERGREEN SCREEN

(NELLIE R STEVENS HOLLY)

ENTRANCE CANOPY

TREE, TYP.

(SHUMARD OAK)

INTERIOR PARKING

ISLAND CANOPY TREE,

TYP. (WILLOW OAK)

PINE MIX, TYP. (VIRGINIA

PINE, WHITE PINE)

INTERIOR PARKING ISLAND

TREE, TYP. (NUTTALL OAK)

CANOPY TREES AT OPEN

GREENSPACE AREA, TYP.

(TULIP POPLAR)

INTERIOR PARKING

ISLAND CANOPY TREE,

TYP. (SHUMARD OAK)

PROPERTY

LINE, TYP.

PROPERTY

LINE, TYP.

PROPERTY

LINE, TYP.

(11) INTERIOR PARKING CANOPY TREES
(2" CAL. NUTTALL OAK) AND (26) STREET
TREES (2" CAL. NUTTALL OAK)

(16) EVERGREEN SCREEN (6' HT. NELLIE R
STEVENS HOLLY) PLANTED AT 8' O.C.

(600) EVERGREEN BUFFER TREE (6' HT.
PINE MIX - VIRGINIA PINE, WHITE PINE)
PLANTED AT 12' O.C.

PARKING LOT LIGHT,

TYP, SEE 2 / LA5.92

PARKING LOT LIGHT,

TYP, SEE 2 / LA5.92

MONUMENT SIGN

SETBACK 10' FROM

PROPERTY LINE, SEE

DETAIL 1 / LC5.91

EXISTING TREES TO

BE REMOVED, TYP.

EXISTING

TREES TO BE

REMOVED

PEDESTRIAN LIGHT,

TYP, SEE 1 / LA5.92

SITE WALL,

TYP., SEE CIVIL

STORMWATER

POND, SEE CIVIL

STORMWATER

POND, SEE CIVIL

STORMWATER

POND, SEE CIVIL

UTILITY

EASEMENT

UTILITY

EASEMENT

OVERHEAD POWER

LINES, TYP.

OVERHEAD POWER

LINES, TYP.

PINE MIX, TYP. (VIRGINIA

PINE, WHITE PINE)

STREET TREE, TYP.

(NUTTALL OAK)

OPEN SPACE

POSSIBLE USES INCLUDE DOG

PARK / RECREATION LAWN

1 10/27/2016

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



Date:
Drawn by:

Job Number:

Reviewed by:

Revision:

  Sheet Number:

Date:

 10/25/2016             3:45pm             S:\Work\Clients\Arlington\Knoxville Snyder\AutoCAD\Sheet Files\Code\X-Code 20161025.dwg,LA5.90,     mphillips

LA
N

D
SC

A
PE

 D
E

T
A

IL
S

09/28/2016

MP

RCC / MO

21532.5

A
rl

in
gt

on
 P

ro
pe

rt
ie

s
21

17
 S

ec
on

d 
A

ve
nu

e 
N

or
th

, S
ui

te
 3

00

T
A

PE
ST

R
Y

 T
U

R
K

E
Y

 C
R

E
E

K
K

no
xv

ill
e,

 T
N

B
ir

m
in

gh
am

, A
L

U
O

R
 S

U
B

M
IT

T
A

L-
LA

N
D

SC
A

PE
 P

LA
N

UOR SUBMITTAL-LANDSCAPE PLAN
LA5.90

1 
5 

0 
  W

.  
 J

 E
 S

 S
 U

 P
   

A
 V

 E
 N

 U
 E

L 
O

 N
 G

 W
 O

 O
 D

,  
F 

L 
O

 R
 I 

D
 A

T 
E 

L 
  4

 0
 7

 . 
6 

6 
7 

. 1
 7

 7
 7

F 
A

 X
   

4 
0 

7 
. 6

 6
 7

 . 
1 

7 
7 

9

+

EXISTING GRADE

MULCH LAYER

Y

2Y

TOPSOIL BACKFILL

ADDITIONAL 1" OF TOPSOIL

FOR SHRUBS

ADDITIONAL 4" OF TOPSOIL

FOR ALL PLANTING BEDS

COMPACTED SUBGRADE

PLANT 1-1/2" TO 2" HIGH

A

B

BEDLINE

CURB

A

B

SHRUBS AND GROUNDCOVERS ADJACENT TO STRAIGHT

EDGES SHALL BE TRIANGULAR - SPACED IN ROWS

PARALLEL TO THE STRAIGHT EDGE.

SHRUBS AND GROUNDCOVERS ADJACENT TO CURVED

EDGES SHALL BE PLANTED IN ROWS PARALLEL TO THE

CURVED EDGE.  CURVED EDGES TO BE VERY SMOOTH RADII.

MULCH LAYER 3' DIAMETER

TOPSOIL BACKFILL

ADDITIONAL 2" OF TOPSOIL

FOR TREES

EXISTING GRADE

ADDITIONAL 4" OF TOPSOIL

FOR ALL PLANTING BEDS

COMPACTED SUBGRADE

TURNBUCKLE

WHITE PVC

TRUNK SHALL BE MAINTAINED

IN A VERTICAL POSITION

PROTECTIVE RUBBER HOSE

GUY WIRES SHALL BE KEPT TAUT

REMOVE ROPE AT TRUNK

AND TOP OF BURLAP

2" X 2" X 18" STAKE (3)

X

2X

PLANT TREES 2" - 4" HIGH

EVERGREEN SCREEN FOR AIR CONDITIONER UNITS

SCALE: NTS

SCREEN PANEL FOR AIR CONDITIONER UNITS

SCALE: NTS

EVERGREEN SCREEN FOR TRANSFORMERS

SCALE: NTS

TYPICAL TREE PLANTING - CROSS SECTION

SCALE: NTS

TYPICAL SHRUB PLANTING - CROSS SECTION

SCALE: NTS

TYPICAL SHRUB LAYOUT - PLAN

SCALE: NTS

NOTE:

REFER TO LOCAL CODE FOR CLEARANCE REQUIREMENTS.  PLANTINGS SHOULD

COMPLETELY SURROUND TRANSFORMER TO SCREEN VIEWS FROM UNITS, SIDEWALKS

AND ROADS.  NOTIFY LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT OF DISCREPANCY BETWEEN PLAN AND

SITE CONDITIONS.

EVERGREEN SHRUBS PLANTED AROUND

PERIMETER OF TRANSFORMERS.  SHRUBS

SHALL BE 7 GALLON (36" HT. AT INSTALL)

PLANTED 36" O.C.

TRANSFORMER

AC UNIT

FACE OF BUILDING

EXTERIOR WALL

EVERGREEN SHRUBS PLANTED AROUND

PERIMETER OF AC UNITS.  SHRUBS SHALL BE 7

GALLON (36" HT. AT INSTALL) PLANTED 36" O.C.

24" CLEARANCE BETWEEN

EDGE OF EVERGREEN

SHRUBS AND AC UNIT

NOTE:

IF PLANTING AREA IS LIMITED, NOTIFY LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT

AND/OR OWNER TO CONFIRM USE OF WOODEN SCREEN

2
'

2'

PICKETS, 2" X 45", SELECT NORTHERN

WHITE CEDAR, STAINED TO MATCH

RAILINGS, DOUBLE NAILED TO

STRINGERS

POSTS, 3X3, SELECT NORTHERN WHITE

CEDAR, STAINED TO MATCH RAILINGS

STRINGERS, 2X4, SELECT NORTHERN

WHITE CEDAR, STAINED TO MATCH

RAILINGS

CONCRETE FOOTING, 3000 psi, MIN 4"

WIDTH ALL AROUND POST

FINISH GRADE

5'

5"

4
'

2
'
-
6

"
1

'

1
'

6
"

1 10/27/2016

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



SIGN ARM: 6"X12"

CEDAR BEAM

AA

6'-4"4'-0"

REVIEW AND CONFIRM LOCATION OF SIGN

COLUMN AND PLANTER WALL IN THE FIELD

WITH LANDSCAPE ARCHITECT OR OWNER'S

REPRESENTATIVE PRIOR TO

CONSTRUCTING

C
O

N
C

R
E

T
E

 
C

U
R

B
,
 
S

E
E

 
C

I
V

I
L

12'-4"

SIGN COLUMN
CC

10' SETBACK FROM

PROPERTY LINE

14'-0"

PLANTER WALL

1
2
'
-
0
"

NOTE:  SIGN CONTRACTOR TO SUBMIT

SHOP DRAWINGS TO OWNER/ L.A. FOR

APPROVAL SHOWING MATERIALS,

FINISHES, & STRUCTURE

4'-0" 6'-4"

8
'
-
6

"

STONE VENEER TO MATCH

ARCHITECTURE, TYP.

STONE VENEER

TO MATCH

ARCHITECTURE,

TYP.

PLANTER WALL

8
'
-
6
"

STONE VENEER TO MATCH

ARCHITECTURE, TYP.

SIGN ARM: 6"X12" CEDAR

BEAM

AA

DOUBLE-SIDED SIGN PANEL, 48"

SQUARE X 3" THICK. FINAL SIGN

LAYOUT AND GRAPHICS TO

MATCH PHASE 1

EE

Date:
Drawn by:

Job Number:

Reviewed by:

Revision:

  Sheet Number:

Date:

 10/25/2016             3:45pm             S:\Work\Clients\Arlington\Knoxville Snyder\AutoCAD\Sheet Files\Code\X-Code 20161025.dwg,LA5.91,     mphillips

SI
G

N
 D

E
T

A
IL

S

09/28/2016

MP

RCC / MO

21532.5

A
rl

in
gt

on
 P

ro
pe

rt
ie

s
21

17
 S

ec
on

d 
A

ve
nu

e 
N

or
th

, S
ui

te
 3

00

T
A

PE
ST

R
Y

 T
U

R
K

E
Y

 C
R

E
E

K
K

no
xv

ill
e,

 T
N

B
ir

m
in

gh
am

, A
L

U
O

R
 S

U
B

M
IT

T
A

L-
LA

N
D

SC
A

PE
 P

LA
N

UOR SUBMITTAL-LANDSCAPE PLAN
LA5.91

1 
5 

0 
  W

.  
 J

 E
 S

 S
 U

 P
   

A
 V

 E
 N

 U
 E

L 
O

 N
 G

 W
 O

 O
 D

,  
F 

L 
O

 R
 I 

D
 A

T 
E 

L 
  4

 0
 7

 . 
6 

6 
7 

. 1
 7

 7
 7

F 
A

 X
   

4 
0 

7 
. 6

 6
 7

 . 
1 

7 
7 

9

+

MONUMENT SIGN - PLAN

SCALE: 1/2"=1'-0"

1

LA5.91

MONUMENT SIGN - ELEVATION

SCALE: 1/2"=1'-0"

2

LA5.91

MONUMENT SIGN - ELEVATION

SCALE: 1/2"=1'-0"

3

LA5.91

1 10/27/2016

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR



PRODUCT: MNC MANCHESTER

MANUFACTURER: COOPER LIGHTING, www.cooperlighting.com

MODEL: MNC-150-MP-MT-xx-C-V-M-BK-L

MNC MANCHESTER

150 150W LAMP WATTAGE

MP PULSE START METAL HALIDE LAMP

MT MULTI-TAP VOLTAGE

xx REFRACTOR TYPE (TBD BY MEP)

C CLASSICAL CAGE

V VICTORIAN TOP

M MODERN FINIAL

BK BLACK FINISH

L LAMP INCLUDED

MOUNTED @ 16' AFG ON A  DIRECT BURY ALUMINUM POLE

STANDARD DUTY POLE WITH BLACK FINISH BY

ALLIANCE COMPOSITES, INC., www.alliancecompositesinc.com

PRODUCT: TRIBUTE

MANUFACTURER: COOPER LIGHTING, www.cooperlighting.com

MODEL: MP-TR-3F-250-MT-LL-BK/MA1017BK

MP PULSE START METAL HALIDE

TR TRIBUTE (ARM INCLUDED)

3F TYPE III FORMED DISTRIBUTION

250 250W LAMP WATTAGE

MT MULTI-TAP WIRED 277V

LL LAMP INCLUDED

BK BLACK FINISH

MA1017 SINGLE TENON ADAPTER FOR 2

3

8

" O.D. TENON

MOUNTED @ 18' AFG ON A  DIRECT BURY ALUMINUM POLE

STANDARD DUTY POLE WITH BLACK FINISH BY

ALLIANCE COMPOSITES, INC., www.alliancecompositesinc.com

Date:
Drawn by:

Job Number:

Reviewed by:

Revision:

  Sheet Number:

Date:

 10/25/2016             5:05pm             S:\Work\Clients\Arlington\Knoxville Snyder\AutoCAD\Sheet Files\Code\X-Code 20161025.dwg,LA5.92,     mphillips

LI
G

H
T

IN
G

 S
PE

C
IF

IC
A

T
IO

N
S

09/28/2016

MP

RCC / MO

21532.5

A
rl

in
gt

on
 P

ro
pe

rt
ie

s
21

17
 S

ec
on

d 
A

ve
nu

e 
N

or
th

, S
ui

te
 3

00

T
A

PE
ST

R
Y

 T
U

R
K

E
Y

 C
R

E
E

K
K

no
xv

ill
e,

 T
N

B
ir

m
in

gh
am

, A
L

U
O

R
 S

U
B

M
IT

T
A

L-
LA

N
D

SC
A

PE
 P

LA
N

UOR SUBMITTAL-LANDSCAPE PLAN
LA5.92

1 
5 

0 
  W

.  
 J

 E
 S

 S
 U

 P
   

A
 V

 E
 N

 U
 E

L 
O

 N
 G

 W
 O

 O
 D

,  
F 

L 
O

 R
 I 

D
 A

T 
E 

L 
  4

 0
 7

 . 
6 

6 
7 

. 1
 7

 7
 7

F 
A

 X
   

4 
0 

7 
. 6

 6
 7

 . 
1 

7 
7 

9

+

PEDESTRIAN LIGHT

SCALE: 1/2"=1'-0"

1

LA5.92

PARKING LOT LIGHT

SCALE: 1/2"=1'-0"

2

LA5.92

1 10/27/2016

mreynolds
Revised

mreynolds
Typewritten Text
10-I-16-UR




